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Opinions, Ideas, & Practice - Editorial 
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Methadone is an effective medication to treat opioid use disorder.1 Access to methadone take-
home doses (THDs) is restricted by federal and state guidelines. Before the COVID-19 pandemic, 
patients were obligated to attend opioid treatment programs (OTPs) daily because of concerns 
about the safety of THDs. Eligibility for 14- or 28-day THDs required daily visits over one or two 
years, respectively. Federal regulations for THDs changed during the COVID-19 pandemic, allowing 
OTPs to initiate or extend THDs.2 Emerging data suggest increasing access to THDs does not 
increase adverse events.3–5 

 In March 2020, the Substance Abuse and Mental Health Services Administration (SAMHSA) 
enacted exemptions allowing increased THDs to mitigate severe acute respiratory syndrome 
coronavirus 2 (SARS-CoV-2) infection risk by decongregating OTP settings. Patients were allowed 
14- or 28-day THDs, on provider discretion, regardless of treatment length. However, 
implementation varied across OTPs. We conducted three independent studies on the expanded 
THD exemptions to assess implementation and impact on patients and providers in three 
geographically diverse OTP settings. We report on lessons learned from the implementation of the 
THD exemptions in three vulnerable population groups in Tennessee, California, and Puerto Rico 
exposed to differing sociostructural factors that influence treatment access: OTP financial 
structure, housing status, and incarceration. 



FINANCIAL STRUCTURE IMPACT 

In a multisite, mixed methods study examining the experiences and outcomes of individuals with 
opioid use disorder who received increased THDs (study 1), we noted that the financial structuring 
of one OTP influenced the implementation of regulations during COVID-19. We provide 
observations from October 2020 to March 2021 and comments from a medical director of a for-
profit OTP in Tennessee. Without daily dosing, some for-profit OTPs faced financial loss from 
decreased overall reimbursements because of reduced clinic visits. 

 Several months into the COVID-19 pandemic, some OTPs rolled back THD exemptions 
despite public health and social-distancing guidelines. One medical director stated, “They [the 
OTP] are rolling back the COVID-19 exemption even though the state hasn’t directed OTPs to do so.” 
The director noted that the return to pre–COVID-19 guidelines was primarily attributable to financial 
loss and that it negatively affected patient safety: “We weren’t able to limit the volume of patients in 
the clinic or keep them socially distanced due to [staff] shortages and patients not being given take-
homes.” Many clinicians resigned, some out of frustration with the OTP leadership in limiting THDs. 
“They [clinicians] felt it was unconscionable to have a long line of patients waiting out the door, 
down the block, not socially distanced in the midst of a pandemic.” 

INCREASED AVAILABILITY OF HOUSING IMPACT 

We conducted a qualitative study in California to assess the impact of COVID-19–initiated housing 
interventions on THD expansion with 20 patients and 10 clinicians at a single OTP in San Francisco 
from August to November 2020 (study 2). Patients reported previously experiencing homelessness 
and received housing through COVID-19 hotel placements offered by the city, affording the 
opportunity for THDs. One patient had been stable in methadone maintenance treatment (MMT) for 
17 years but had never received THDs because of unstable housing. Another patient emphasized 
the importance of housing to her recovery and how COVID-19–related housing interventions were 
helpful. Patients new to THDs also faced challenges. One participant described being expelled from 
residential treatment for not immediately notifying staff about her new THDs (Box 1). Hotel 
placement was available only to those who met strict eligibility criteria; those who were younger 
and without health conditions still could not access THDs because of lack of stable housing. 
Additionally, OTP providers discussed how providing THDs for those living in COVID-19 hotels 
offered safer storage compared with shelters (Box 1). Providers said THDs also offered patients 
more flexibility and autonomy in treatment. Providers reported that without housing, success in 
treatment was difficult; patients with stable housing were better able to engage in care. Although 
providers were initially concerned about potential adverse events associated with expanded access 
to THDs, these had not occurred. 

INCARCERATION STATUS IMPACT 

In a study in Puerto Rico, we examined COVID-19 methadone regulations in a prison setting (study 
3). We report on MMT program adjustments to avoid pre- and postrelease disruptions in care. 
Before the COVID-19 pandemic, daily methadone doses were transported from the OTP to the 
prison MMT program. At release, participants register in the corresponding community-based OTP 
to receive services. In February 2020, 88 incarcerated men were enrolled in the MMT program. 
Because of COVID-19, admissions were postponed until October 2020. Participants were provided 



with guidance on COVID-19 prevention measures, and daily delivery and dispensing of methadone 
by the OTP staff was discontinued. One week’s worth of THDs was supplied to the prison MMT 
programs and dispensed by a prison nurse. Other health services were sustained through 
telemedicine. As of September 2020, 33 participants had been released after sentence 
completion. To assist with reentry, THDs were prescribed at release to facilitate service connection 
to community-based OTPs. All participants attended the OTP within several days. At a 30-day 
follow-up, participants continued to engage with community OTPs and did not experience adverse 
outcomes from THDs. 

SUSTAINABILITY 

Across all three studies, we observed how expanded access to THDs affected patient access to 
care. Furthermore, our notes and observations underscore the influence of structural factors in 
implementing exemptions across various treatment settings, geographical location, and patient 
populations. As we continue to face an ongoing public health crisis with both COVID-19 and 
increasing rates of drug overdose deaths, there is a need to maintain exemptions for THDs. 
Although SAMHSA recently announced a continuation of the THD exemption policy,6 it is unclear 
whether these will remain indefinitely. Our three studies highlight the need for more research to 
assess the role of OTP financial structures on THD policies, housing as a barrier to MMT 
stabilization with THDs, and treatment access and transitions to community-based OTPs for 
persons released from incarceration. Future research should explore financial support initiatives 
for private, for-profit MMT programs because of dependence on billing for patient encounters given 
that they constitute nearly half of OTPs in the United States. Policy recommendations include 
expanding coverage, addressing out-of-pocket costs, increasing provider reimbursement, and 
incentivizing system integration.7,8 Housing requirements should be reconsidered, as this may 
challenge, instead of facilitating, treatment stabilization. Furthermore, efforts to minimize housing 
disruptions, including permanent extensions of housing access made available during COVID-19 
and medical–legal partnerships that prevent evictions, play critical roles in accessing THDs. Finally, 
further research is needed to understand the impact of varied state OTP regulations among persons 
released from prison on MMT. This could inform best policy recommendations to ensure treatment 
connection to community OTPs for THDs among an often neglected population.9 

PUBLIC HEALTH SIGNIFICANCE 

The COVID-19 pandemic allowed us to explore the impact of increasing THDs for persons with 
opioid use disorder. We also observed factors that influence provider decisions on THDs, such as 
OTP financial structures and housing. Housing requirements for THDs are a barrier to treatment 
stabilization for patients experiencing homelessness who may otherwise not engage in treatment.  

The pandemic’s unique circumstances facilitated practices enabling uninterrupted care 
and coordinated transition to community services for incarcerated populations. These challenges 
and opportunities inform a public health agenda to better understand how THD exemptions affect 
patient outcomes, safety from overdose, and client-centered care. 
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