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Introduction 
Grouped patterns of pigmented lesions are infrequent. Of the several reports of agminated nevi, most have been Spitz nevi or blue 
nevi. The distribution of these nevi is often segmental, following a dermatome or the lines of Blaschko. Most segmental nevi are 
not agminated and develop early in childhood [1]. We describe a rare case of congenital agminated segmental nevi on the chest. 

Key Words: congenital nevi, agminated nevi, segmental nevi 

Case synopsis 
A 21-year-old man was referred with numerous pigmented papules on the right side of his chest (Figure 1). The lesions had been 
present at birth and had not recently changed in size, color, or texture. The patient was well and had no family history of genetic 
disorders, melanoma, or dysplastic nevi. Examination showed numerous disseminated brown and skin-colored soft papules. Each 
measured up to 1 cm in diameter and most were covered with terminal hairs (Figure 2). The lesions were localized to the right side 
of the chest in an agminated distribution. Other body sites were unaffected. 

 

 
Figure 1. Congenital agminated segmental nevi of the chest. Numerous pigmented papules 
on the right side of his chest that had been present at birth and had not recently changed in 

size, color or texture.  



 

 
Figure 2. Congenital agminated segmental nevi of the chest. Numerous disseminated brown and skin-colored soft papules localized to the right 

side of the chest in an agminated distribution. Each measured up to 1 cm in diameter, and most were covered with terminal hairs.  

Two shave biopsies were performed to rule out atypia, one of the upper chest and one of the lower chest. Histologic examination 
was consistent with congenital melanocytic dermal nevi. The epidermis was normal and numerous pigmented nevus cell nests, 
with a partly neuroid pattern, were present in the upper and mid-dermis. These nests were located around blood vessels and hair 
follicles and between collagen fibers. 

Discussion 
Agminated nevi have been reported both as congenital and acquired lesions. They have been reported to follow a Blaschkoid or 
linear distribution. This linear distribution may be owing to a clonal outgrowth of cells, which carry a major gene responsible for 
the development of melanocytic nevi [2]. This clone is thought to originate from a somatic mutation at an early stage of 
embryogenesis [3,4]. Acquired agminated linear nevi may develop along the course of peripheral nerves following cutaneous 
injury [5], after intense exposure to sunlight, or following radiotherapy [6]. The relationship with cutaneous innervation by 
peripheral nerves suggests that developing melanocytes are under neural control [7].  

Most segmental nevi are not agminated [1] and arise because of perturbations in the proliferation, migration, and differentiation of 
embryological precursors, including melanocytes [8,9]. Development of numerous acquired melanocytic nevi in a segmental 
distribution suggests mosaicism for a mutation in a nevus-susceptibility gene [10]. Cutaneous mosaicism often manifests as lines 
of Blaschko, a checkerboard pattern, or a phylloid (leaf-like) pattern [3]. Luo et al. recently described a case of segmentally 
arranged, agminated nevi that exhibit intranevic BrafV600E concordance, suggesting a ‘‘driver’’ mosaic model for the 
development of these lesions [11].  

Our patient differs from previously reported cases in the location and distribution of his nevi. His lesions are on the chest and 
follow the lines of Blaschko. In a 2005 report by Bragg et al., the presence of an underlying dysplastic nevus syndrome phenotype 
in 4 of 5 cases of agminated acquired melanocytic nevi raised the possibility that agminated nevi arise as a consequence of 
postzygotic loss of heterozygosity and, thus, may represent a type 2 segmental manifestation of the atypical mole syndrome 
phenotype [12]. Whether or not congenital agminated segmental nevi undergo malignant change is unknown, but long-term 
follow-up is recommended. 
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