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(Chi2520.67, p<0.001) and AD (Chi2513.02, p<0.001)
were significantly different from normal subjects. Multivari-
ate analysis confirmed the association of PPI use to MCI/
AD diagnosis. (F statistic 3.875 on 4 and 339 DF, p-val-
ue50.0043). Visual analysis of residuals suggested nonlinear
residual error distribution in the MCI/AD subjects. PPI use
is also associated to AD diagnosis, with normal distribution
of residual error on Q—Q plots. (F-statistic: 5.213 on 4
and 228 DF, p-value<0.001). Mutivariate dose models ana-
lyzed available doses of omeprazole 10, 20, 40, 80 mg; pan-
troprazole 20, 40, 80 mg; esomeprazole 10, 20, 40 mg,
lansoprazole 30 mg; dexlansopraole 60 mg doses as individ-
ual factors affecting diagnosis. Omeprazole 20 mg, 40 mg
and pantoprazole 20 mg doses were significantly associated
with diagnosis in the MCI/AD (F-statistic: 3.642 on 15 and
328 DF, p-value<0.001) and AD groups (F-statistic: 3.921
on 14 and 218 DF, p-value<0.001). Other doses or agents
were not associated with diagnosis. However, stepwise
regression could not eliminate other doses and agents as fac-
tors from the overall regression model.

Conclusion: PPI use is significantly associated with
MCI/AD or AD diagnosis. Lower doses of omeprazole 20
and 40 mg and pantoprazole 20 mg doses are significantly
related to diagnosis. Confounding from PPI use duration,
non-linear dose responses in MCI/AD subjects needs further
study.

M178. 90 Year Olds Are Less Likely to Fall If They
Were Physically Active Two Decades Earlier: The 901
Study
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Claudia H. Kawas and Maria M. Corrada. Irvine, CA

Objective: To determine if physical activity reported 24
years earlier is associated with the risk of falling and to
examine factors related to falls in the oldest-old.

Background: The risk of falls and injuries sustained
from falls increase with age. Although risk factors for falls
in the elderly have been well characterized, only limited
information is available about the oldest-old, people 90
years and older.

Methods: The study included 1536 participants from
The 901 Study, a longitudinal investigation of aging and
dementia in the oldest-old. Participants were originally
members of the Leisure World Cohort Study (LWCS), an
epidemiological study of life style practices. Falls (yes/no)
were reported by a participant or informant at the baseline
examination of The 901 Study. Other factors also reported
at the baseline examination and known to be related to falls
in younger elderly were also examined. Physical activity
information was collected in the LWCS 24 years earlier
(range:16-34) and was reported as 15 minutes, 30-45
minutes, or 11 hour/day. Using logistic regression we
examined the relationship between physical activity reported
24 years earlier and falls.

Results: At The 901 baseline visit, participants were on
average 94 years (range590-107), most were women (78%),
and had at least a college degree (52%). Falls were reported
by 52% (N5 799) of participants and were associated with

a higher number of prescription medications, history of TIA
or stroke, depression, arthritis, vision disease, heart disease,
presence of dementia, and use of assistive devices. After
adjusting for potential confounders, and compared to peo-
ple who reported no physical activity, activity of 301
minutes/day was associated with approximately a 30% lower
likelihood of falling. The falls odds ratios were 0.63
(p50.03) for 30-45 minutes/day and 0.66 (p50.03) for
11 hour/day.

Conclusions: People over 90 have an especially high risk
of falling for a variety of reasons such as overall deteriora-
tion of health and increased functional impairment and dis-
abilities due to neurodegenerative diseases. Previous physical
activity was related to lower risk of falling even in the pres-
ence of comorbidities or needing assistive devices. Regular
physical activity may be a good strategy to reduce falls in
the oldest-old and could provide an intervention to prevent
falls in this rapidly growing age group.

M179. The Hippocampal Network Model: A
Neuroimaging Approach to Identifying Dementia
Biomarkers
Eithan Kotkowski and Peter T. Fox. San Antonio, TX

Metabolic syndrome or systemic metabolic dysfunction
(SMD) is one of the most common disease states dispro-
portionately afflicting the Hispanic population in the Unit-
ed States. Evidence suggests that effects of SMD and
neurocognitive dysfunction are bidirectional and complex,
with genetic, environmental, and behavioral causes (Biessels
et al., 2014). It has been recently shown that the underly-
ing pathology does not resemble that of AD (Abner et al.,
2016). Studies using contrast-enhanced MRI show age-
dependent blood-brain barrier (BBB) breakdown in the
hippocampus, worsening with mild cognitive impairment
and correlating with injuries to the BBB pericytes (Mon-
tagne et al., 2015). Rodent models have also implicated the
hippocampus in cognitive deficits resulting from T2DM
(Stranahan et al., 2008). Consequently, we propose to cre-
ate a hippocampal network model (HNM), using meta-
analytic co-activation modeling (MACM) and structural
equation modeling (SEM), to detect and quantify network
abnormalities associated with neurocognitive decline in
SMD. Our immediate research goal is to create functional
and structural meta-analytic connectivity maps (FMACM
and SMACM) of the hippocampi in order to develop the
HNM that can be used to assess cognitive impairments in
individuals with metabolic syndrome. Our preliminary data
has found 13 key nodes of functional connectivity with
each individual hippocampus (right and left) all of which
address highly significant behavioral paradigms known to
be affected in individuals with dementia (i.e. working and
explicit memory, cognition, etc.) We hypothesize that
SMACM and FMCAM will jointly identify an extended
hippocampal connectivity network with different compo-
nents being associated with different behavioral domains
and neuropsychiatric disorders.
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(Chi2520.67, p<0.001) and AD (Chi2513.02, p<0.001)
were significantly different from normal subjects. Multivari-
ate analysis confirmed the association of PPI use to MCI/
AD diagnosis. (F statistic 3.875 on 4 and 339 DF, p-val-
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residual error distribution in the MCI/AD subjects. PPI use
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with diagnosis in the MCI/AD (F-statistic: 3.642 on 15 and
328 DF, p-value<0.001) and AD groups (F-statistic: 3.921
on 14 and 218 DF, p-value<0.001). Other doses or agents
were not associated with diagnosis. However, stepwise
regression could not eliminate other doses and agents as fac-
tors from the overall regression model.

Conclusion: PPI use is significantly associated with
MCI/AD or AD diagnosis. Lower doses of omeprazole 20
and 40 mg and pantoprazole 20 mg doses are significantly
related to diagnosis. Confounding from PPI use duration,
non-linear dose responses in MCI/AD subjects needs further
study.
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